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     It is early Sunday morning and I sit here reflecting at 
TimoleonÕs Diner in quaint Keene, New Hampshire while 
drinking some coffee to warm me up (it is 45 degrees outside, 
chilly for a Texan). The Yankee Bottle Show starts here shortly 
and will be a fun conclusion to a long weekend of bottle events 
that started out with a gathering at Federation members Mark 
and Annie VuonoÕs in Stamford, Connecticut on Friday and 
included the Heckler Columbus Day Hayfield event in Wood-
stock Valley, Connecticut yesterday. I am thinking that this 
was the exact spot, two years ago today, that the great 
Feldmann story that I retell in this issue of Bottles and Extras, 
got its wings. I hope you enjoy the article and pictures. John 
and Sheila are wonderful people that represent the foundation 
and cornerstone of our great hobby.
     What a whirlwind of events since our great EXPO in late 
July in Reno, Nevada. Every time I think of this event, I am 
reminded of how grateful I am, and we all should be, of Marty 
Hall, Richard Siri, the Reno Bottle Club and the legions of 
helpers that pulled off this mega event. Marty even reported a 
strong financial success that demonstrates yet again, that our 
organization is getting stronger and marching forward. The 
2013 FOHBC National in Manchester, New Hampshire next 
year is progressing smoothly with a majority of the tables 
already being sold. Lexington, Kentucky will be our location 
for the 2014 National, so make your plans here, too. You can 
get information for both events by visiting our website, 
FOHBC.org. Tom Phillips, our Conventions Director, was 
even in the southeast this week looking at venues for the 2015 
National. It was not too long ago that we were much more 
short-sighted. Now with this advance planning and public 
announcements, we can stake our claim on a date that will help 
other show chairmen decide when to hold their events. As an 
aside, did you know that there were nine bottle shows this 
weekend, including one across the pond? Our hobby is so 
strong. I see the glimmer of change even with our shows. LetÕs 
promote more and grow our hobby. Bring people to the shows. 
Bottles, glass and positive change are contagious.

     Federation membership is also drastically up which is excit-
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ing. We will be announcing a major new membership drive 
later this month that uses a 2,000-member target. We are 
nearing 1,200 members now. So if you are a member, stay with 
us, if youÕre are undecided, please join! There are so many 
exciting things planned. Our magazine, Bottles and Extras, is 
undergoing a major face lift, we have a new web site, by the 
time you read this, we will be 1,000 members plus on our 
FOHBC facebook page, the FOHBC Virtual Museum is 
moving forward (look for a major announcement soon) and we 
have just sent our first digital newsletter to a large audience of 
people. The new Federation, your FOHBC. 
     We need new blood and persons to carry the torch. I will be 
reaching out to some of our membership for pictures of your 
bottles, assistance on the web site, articles and stories for 
Bottles and Extras, the web site, the newsletter and help on the 
Virtual Museum. If you would like to volunteer, in any area, it 
would be very much welcomed and appreciated.
     You will also notice a new section in the front of Bottles and 
Extras called Letters to the Editor. I am not sure why this was 
not there in some form or another before but we really want to 
hear your stories and ideas and how we can do things better. 
You can send an e-mail, write a letter or call any board 
member, including myself at any time. Our contact information 
is in this magazine and on the web site.
     In the January/February 2013 issue of Bottles and Extras, we 
will be starting a two-page Regional Overview section where 
we will highlight incoming information from the four regions 
that make up the Federation (northeast, southern, midwest and 
western). If you have material please forward to your Regional 
Director. If you visit the web site or received our newsletter, 
you will see that Regional News is now appearing in a different 
and more refreshing format in these venues too.
     We are only as strong as our weakest link. I use this expres-
sion often in business and in my general conversations with 
people. Keep an open mind, be positive, and try to help, give 
constructive criticism and move forward. Smile and someone 
will smile back to you. Listen and you will hear a story. Step 
forward and tell a story. Look at your collection and find that 
missing bottle or link. This is what it is all about. Our best asset 
is all of our great members. 
     I am also looking forward to the great 49er Bottle Show in 
Old Town Auburn, California in December. We usually go to 
the Festival of Lights parade each year after the show. We love 
it because the horses, dogs, goats, people and trucks all are 
adorned with lights for Christmas. Remember, a show is so 
much better if you make it an experience. While you are at a 
show, visit a collection, go to a museum, have dinner with a 
bottle friend, go on a dig etc. There are so many things you can 
do to stay connected with our great hobby. Make it a multi-
dimensional experience. Happy autumn and winter.

President’s Message

President John F. Kennedy, in his inaugural address on 

January 20, 1961 said,  “Ask not what your country can 

do for you - ask what you can do for your  country.” One of the 

greatest sayings ever. Let us now apply this to our great hobby 

and say “What can you do for your  hobby?”

There is an alarming communication from the Pennsylvania 

Bottle Collectors Association in the FOHBC News section of 

this issue considering the dwindling membership of their club. 

Apparently back in the 1970s, they had over 200 members and 

now they are down to about 20 members with only 12 or so 

being active. This is consistent with concerns that we hear with 

any club, organization or business that has not kept a close eye 

on or kept up with the pace of the rapidly changing world. We 

can not continue to rely on our laurels, our past successes, our 

memories or the great persons in our hobby before us. We must 

change. Change is good but we have to take our medicine to 

get better. Generally speaking, people are uncomfortable with 

change because they know it will get them “out of their groove” 

and that they may have to do some unanticipated work. We need 

to plan our new roads to the future and we need to repair our 

roads of the past. We need to build.

Does this all mean that people do not like antique bottles 

and glass as much, or that people do not like to get together and 

look at and collect glass like the past golden shows or clubs of  

yesteryear? Of course not. There are more people, from every 

age group, in our  hobby than ever before and they are from all 

areas of our great country and globe. As our core demographic 

for a typical collector hovers around the age of 50 years old 

or so, we see more children, young adults, women and diverse 

groups in our hobby than ever before. So what is happening?

It is simple. Just like the horse and buggy, 8-track cassette, 

fax machine, the newspaper, music store, book store and soon 

the library, the bottle show and the local club meetings will go 

to the wayside too unless we adapt to the new world and access 

how we are doing things and understand who our audience 

is. Are we providing an experience for this new generation 

of collectors who are accustomed to instant gratification and 
access to any information they need in a few quick taps on their 

keyboard? Readers, these new collectors collect any possible 

glass object you can imagine and they communicate 365 days 

a year, 24 hours a day, 7 days a week looking for camaraderie 

and knowledge. They are as passionate, if not more, about antique 

bottles and glass than any generation before us.

You may be getting discouraged at this point and think that 

there is no hope. Stop. As we mentioned above, with all of the 

things that are leaving our familiarity and comfort zone, we still 

have the museum. For the most part, museums have evolved with 

change better than any other faction of the antique and historical 

world. Museums have adapted and are growing, they are bringing 

in more people, they are  increasing their membership through 

many types of programs and they have an active digital presence. 

We must remember, nothing will ever replace or beat looking at a 

real piece of art or glass in an educational, constantly changing and 

awe-inspiring environment. The museums will remain and be our 

portals to the past. Can we apply this to the Federation, our shows 

and our meetings? You bet.

We need to marry this new generation of collectors who live 

online and we must make the Federation of Historical Bottle 

Collectors our ‘museum’ and the “go to” organization and source 

for rejuvenation, regeneration, information and friendship. We 

need to help make our member club shows be multi-dimensional, 

we must embrace all generations and areas of collectability and 

we must have an experience at every bottle event or touch-point. 

Communication, dialog, competitions, exhibitions, seminars, 

banquets, picnics, field trips, assistance in identifying and related 
bottle events that occur around a major bottle event work. Just 

look at our FOHBC National Shows, the Baltimore Antique Bottle 

Show and club, the Columbus Day Heckler Hayfield Event or the 
49er Antique Bottle Show and club to see why some clubs and 

shows prosper and grow.

The FOHBC is working harder than ever to provide value and 

experience to your membership with a rejuvenated Bottles and 

Extras, a refreshing web site, exciting national shows, bottle events 

like our recent ‘shootout’ in Reno and upcoming “New England 

Bottle Battle” at the 2013 National Antique Bottle Show in 

Manchester, New Hampshire in July, the planned Virtual Museum 

of Historical Glass, contests and awards, an electronic newsletter, 

etc. The membership deserves this and it is our privilege and 

pleasure to bring these efforts to you in excellent order.

Please consider stepping up to help your local club, attend 

your club meeting, write about your collection or digging 

adventures, exhibit your passion, be a volunteer, become an officer, 
provide security, set-up or take down a show, and give us your 

ideas. Once we get the dust off our shoulders and tables, take 

that medicine, we will get better. Better than ever that is. Change 

is good. Please step up and ask yourself, “What can I do for the 

hobby?” Thank you, we hope you are all having a wonderful 

holiday season and that Santa has brought some new bottles and 

that your New Year is prosperous, safe and healthy.


